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MONTHLY ACTIVITIES OF SIALKOT CHAMBER
VISIT OF MR. SHAHID BASHIR, PAKISTAN'S EX-

AMBASSADOR TO WTO

Mr. Shahid Bashir, Pakistan's Ex-Ambassador in 
WTO visited the SCCI on September 28, 2021. He 
thanked and shared his experience at various 
p o s i t i o n s  i n  pu b l i c  s e c t o r  a n d  a s  t h e 
Ambassador/Permanent Representative to the 
WTO. Mr. Khurram Aslam, Mr. Ikram-ul-Haq, Mr. 
Waqas Akram Awan, Mr. Salman Sheikh and other 
members discussed the facts about the Surgical 
Industry of Sialkot, its trade figures, impediments 
and suggestions for their growth & development. 
Fact presented by a BBC Report was shared that 
Sialkot had providing approximately 90% of the 
metal-based surgical instruments around the 
globe. Govt. should be supported in imports of 
technical machinery either new or used machines 
to enhance the production capacity as well as the 
quality of the surgical products. it was discussed 
that joint ventures should be promoted on 
Government level in order to bring the foreign 
investment and to work on import substitutes. It 
was also discussed that Sialkot Industry was 
combating for its survival but with certain 
support, this city can do wonders due to its actual 
potential. Furthermore, Raw-Material Bank 
should be established to minimize or eliminate the 
issues regarding availability of desired quality 
materials on justified price. 

Mr. Shahid Bashir, Pakistan's Ex-Ambassador to 
WTO thanked for the feedback by the Sialkot 
Chamber and also acknowledged the inputs of 
Sialkot Surgical Industry to design and refine the 
research project. Mr. Ikram-ul-Haq thanked Mr. 
Shahid Bashir, Pakistan's Ex-Ambassador to 

WTO for his visit to discuss an important matter 
and assured that the required information would 
be provided to him at the earliest. He also thanked 
all the participants for their inputs. 

MEETINGS ON TRADE DELEGATION TO TURKEY 
DELEGATION 

A meeting was held on 11th October 2021, Chaired 
by Mr. Khuram Aslam, Former Senior Vice 
President, on Turkey Delegation. During the 
meeting Mr. Aslam briefed about the hotel 
booking and advised the Delegates to confirm 
their air tickets as soon as possible. He further 
inquired about the status of Visas of Delegates. 
He shared that a supporting letter from Sialkot 
Chamber of Commerce and Industry was also 
written to Consul General of Turkey in Lahore to 
issue visas to applicants. He added that COVID-19 
PCR test should be done within 48 hours before 
taking the flights and mentioned the documents 
to be kept during the trip. He shared that the final 
schedule of the meetings will be shared once 
received from the Consul General of Pakistan in 
Istanbul. 

MEETING ON TRADE DELEGATION TO 
UKRAINE DELEGATION 

Meetings were held on 11 Oct & 16 Oct 2021 at 
SCCI to discuss the SCCI's Trade Delegation to 
Ukraine. 1st meeting was organized to discuss the 
execution of Trade Delegation. Mr. Khuram Aslam, 
Former Senior Vice President, presided the 
meeting to discuss the Ukraine Delegation and 
discussed about the status of Visas of Delegates 
and Air Tickets booking of the Delegates. 



Mr. Khuram Aslam, Former SVP, chaired another 
meeting on 16th October 2021, wherein he 
informed with the Delegates should get their 
COVID-19 PCR test 48 hours before the flight. He 
also shared that the hotel booking had been 
completed by the Embassy of Pakistan and 
details would be shared on WhatsApp group of 
Delegation. Three members Committee will look 
after the expense of the Delegation; whereas, 
refund policy was also elaborated in detail.  

MEETING WITH MR. FARRUKH H. KHAN, CEO/MD 
OF PAKISTAN STOCK EXCHANGE

Mian Imran Akbar, President SCCI welcomed Mr. 
Farrukh H. Khan, CEO/MD of Pakistan Stock 
Exchange (PSX) to visit the Sialkot Chamber on 
October 21, 2021. He expressed his satisfaction 
that Pakistan Stock exchange was being led by Mr. 
Farrukh who was an experienced economist and 
provided his services in privatization of various 
organizations, guiding in financial matters and 
bringing international investment to Pakistan, he 
added. He addressed the audience that SMEs 
were considered important in the entire world as 
they boosted the industrial economy, provided 
employment, enhanced skills of laborers, equally 
distributed wealth and promoted trade. Sialkot 
considered as the center of SMEs and they had 
been offering their best to develop the cottage 
industry, the goods manufactured in Sialkot 
carried global repute and demand in international 
market. The President stated that, even though 
the Covid-19 pandemic damaged the big 
economies, the Sialkot export-oriented sector 
experienced growth and earned more than 2.5 
billion USD foreign exchange to support the 

economy of Pakistan. “Pakistan Stock exchange 
had played its role well to bring investment to 
SMEs to increase their capital and valuation of 
assets”, he added.

Mr. Farrukh H. Khan thanked the SCCI and invited 
participants to visit Pakistan Stock Market at 
Karachi to get introduction and awareness about 
capital market. He told about the PSX had the 
vision to provide a fair, transparent and efficient 
marketplace to facilitate capital formation for the 
benefit of all stakeholders. PSX had achieved 
many milestones such as in June 2017, 20% stake 
of PSX was acquired by the general public by 
public offering. PSX ownership was shared 
between China Financial Futures Exchange, 
Shanghai Stock Exchange, Shenzhen Stock 
Exchange, Pak-China Investment Company 
Limited and HBL, where patterns of shareholding 
were divided into 40% to Chinese Consortium and 
60% General Public, Corporate Entities & Other 
Foreign Investors, he added. He shared about the 
role of PSX in the economy as a capital provider 
to the businesses, growth indicator, and a source 
to attract foreign exchange/capital etc. 
Companies listed on PSX provided employment 
and benefits to millions of Pakistanis and their 
families and generated significant tax income to 
the Government of Pakistan. 

DEPARTMENTAL COMMITTEE ON GARRISON 
HQ/CANTONMENT BOARD AFFAIRS 

Meeting of Departmental Committee on Garrison 
HQ/Cantonment Board Affairs was held October 
23, 2021 and chaired by Sheikh Zahid Hameed, 
Chairman Committee. He mentioned the names 
of previous five Presidents and acknowledged the 
learning from the last five tenures. He gave a 
presentat ion to  descr ibe the prev ious 
performance of the Committee for the members. 
He shared pictorial views of some areas and also 
s h a r e d  h i s  s u g g e s t i o n s  r e g a r d i n g  t h e 
commercialization of the area on Khawaja Safdar 
Road. He also shared his idea about the 
Cantonment Board Dispensary to collaborate 
with the Cantonment Management with the aim 
to upgrade the dispensary for providing the 
quality medical facility to the residents of 
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Cantonment Area. He also told the house about 
the movable cold box for dead bodies was 
available in the graveyard near coca cola factory. 
He stressed that the SCCI's Departmental 
Committee on Garrison HQ/Cantonment Board 
Affairs should be focused on the above-cited 
concerns as well as the improvements, with the 
support of all the members and high-up's of the 
Chamber. 

Members appreciated the performance of the 
Committee & Chairman and shared their valuable 
suggestions for above-discussed matters. The 
proposed project about the up gradation of 
Cantonment Board Dispensary was appreciated. 
Members recommended that it would be more 
effective that Minutes of the Meetings would be 
shared with the Cantonment Management to 
communicate the current matters & concerns to 
them on regular basis. 

MEETING OF DEPARTMENTAL COMMITTEE ON 
CRIME WATCH / CYBER CRIME/CPLC

Mr. Nasir Saleem Mirza, Chairman presided the 
Committee meeting on October 25, 2021. He 
discussed the issues regarding Law & Order and 
Traffic Management System in Sialkot in order to 
facilitate business community and citizens. He 
also emphasized to establish a “Driving license 
Desk” at Sialkot Chamber for facilitation of 
Members. The Chairman invited suggestions and 
proposals from the committee members for the 
improvement of traffic management system and 
committee performance.  

Members congratulated the Chairman on 
assuming Charge as Chairman Committee and 
suggested that the awareness lecture should be 

arranged in different Schools and Colleges in 
which ASP, DSP Traffic Police and Representative 
of Chamber may deliver the lecture and educate 
the students for observing traffic rules; whereas, 
members also shared their suggestion regarding 
the traffic management, low manpower in traffic 
police, number of parking stands tenders issued 
by TMA on almost all roads of Sialkot and poor 
road constructions etc. 

Mr. Zohaib Rafique Sethi, Senior Vice President 
SCCI endorsed to arrange awareness seminars 
for public. In conclusion, the Chairman assured 
that all above said recommendations would be 
workable but time taking; therefore, all the 
committee members should extend maximum 
cooperation for early resolution of the problems 
of the members of Sialkot Chamber. 

MEETING OF DEPARTMENTAL COMMITTEE 
ON ACCOUNTS 

The First meeting of Accounts Committee was 
held on October 21,2021 wherein Mr. Malik Naseer 
Ahmed, Chairman, welcomed all the members.  
The Chairman encouraged the new members to 
joning the Committee. Accounts of the Chamber 
for the month of September, 2021 were reviewed 
and suggestions for betterment were given for 
the approval of the Executive Committee.
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JOB WANTED
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